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Designed and woven by Jane Patrick

Santa Sock
Christmas red and a bit of white fuzz are 
all that’s needed for this cute miniature 
sock.

Diffi culty: Easy

Number of Squares: 1

Finished Size: 2-1/4" w x 3” h

Yarn: Brown Sheep Nature Spun, sport, 
N64 Red Fox, 8 yards; Classic Elite La 
Gran, Bleached White, 3 yards.

Loom: Zoom Loom, 6” weaving needle

Notions: Tapestry needle, size 3 crochet 
hook.
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Weaving: Weave one square with 
Nature Spun. Remove from loom and 
leave a tail for sewing.

Finishing: Wash in hot water with a small 
amount of dish soap, alternating with 
cold water, to full to desired size. Press 
out excess water and lay fl at to dry. 
Press.

Assembly: Fold in half and sew the 
selvedges along the long side together 
[1]. Sew diagonally along the one short 
side for the foot, beginning about a ½” 
from the end and tapering to a point 
[2]. Secure the tail and turn inside out for 
a tidy seam. Shape the foot by inserting 
a pencil and pushing on the seam from 
the inside of the sock [3].

Crochet Cuff: Use La Gran. You’ll notice 
that there are pairs of loops along the 
edge. You will make a stitch into each 
of these. Leaving a tail to sew in later, 
insert the crochet hook through a red 
loop, pull a loop of La Gran through 
and single crochet [4]. Repeat until you 
have crocheted all the way around the 
top of the sock. Make two more rows 
[5]. Sew in the ends and add a red yarn 
hanger at the back.
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